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Southwood
, Evercreech, BA4 6LX

Rental £2,250 pcm
3 bedroom Barn Conversion available Now

________________________________________________________________________________

8 Harris Close, Frome, Somerset,
BA11 5JY

lettings@lettings-r-us.co.uk

01373 454 188

Opening Times
Mon 09.00 - 20.00; Tues 09.00 - 20.00

Wed 09.00 - 20.00; Thurs 09.00 - 20.00

Fri 09.00 - 20.00; Sat 09.00 - 20.00;
Sun 09.00 - 20.00
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* Unfurnished
* Converted Barn
* Optional Wrap around House Field

* En-Suite
* Gated Driveway

* Three Bedrooms
* Jack & Jill Bathroom doors to
Ensuite

Situation

**REDUCED** Stunning 3 Double
Bedroom Barn Conversion with
stunning views over open
Countryside, unique property, rarely
available! Located conveniently for
all of Somerset's finest attractions.
Only 5 minutes drive from Castle
Cary Train station with a direct line to
London. A Beautiful renovated barn
situated within the grounds of a
former farm dating back to the
1700s. Private parking and fenced
garden. This memorable place is
anything but ordinary, boasting
country views across rolling
Somerset hills, inside is a warm cosy
space to spend days relaxing at
home in a Sanctuary country style
retreat with easy access to
everything Somerset has to offer.
One well trained dog will be
considered. Step into your own
private country lodge with wonderful
views of the rolling landscape. A
perfect retreat for couples or a family
to unwind and take in the countryside
or get out and explore. The location
is within easy reach of all the
wonders Somerset and the
surrounding counties have to offer,
from The Newt, Longleat, Bath and
Glastonbury Festival. In a car the
Lodge is 5 minutes from Castle Cary
Station and 2 minutes from the
Festival drop off point. The Kitchen
has a dishwasher and washer dryer
(that can be removed if required).
The Lodge has been restored with
homely warming touches which go
hand in hand with the surrounding
landscape and is available
unfurnished. The Lodge has a large
living/dining space with a double
height wall of glass to look out at the
fields and sunsets and watch the
evenings close in. Dimmable lighting
really sets the mood for a cosy
evening spent enjoying dinner in,
watching a film or playing some
board games. Spend it soaking in the
bath with a book or venture outside
to gaze at the stars. In the morning
wake up to views of the sun rising
over the hill and hear the birds busy
out in hedgerows and fields. The
building sits within the grounds of a
former farm next door to the old
farmhouse so you are likely to see
chickens wondering around the
fields. The accommodation
comprises: Full length Glass
Doors/Windows to the stunning
lounge diner with country side views
as far as the eye can see. Adjoining
kitchen and cloakroom, stairs from
the lounge to the upper mezzanine
level overlooking the lower floor and
leading to the bedrooms. Bedroom 1
- Huge double room, King size bed,
roll top slipper bath, separate
en-suite toilet Bedroom 2 - Huge
double room, King size bed Bedroom
3 - Huge double room, King size bed,
jack-and-jill access to downstairs
shower room. A small paddock can
be included in the tenancy if
required. CALL TO BOOK A
VIEWING TODAY!!! Available NOW!
EPC - D TENANTS: If you choose to
take the tenancy on one of our
properties; we will ask you to pay a
holding deposit of one week’s rent
per property. This is taken as a
holding deposit to reserve you the
Property and will be reimbursed off
of the first month’s rent, unless you
fail the credit checks and referencing
and then we will be entitled to deduct
and retain from the holding deposit.
E.G. If the rent is £850pcm then the
holding fee will be £196.15. We will
be entitled to deduct and retain from
the holding deposit if you decide to
withdraw from the tenancy or if you
fail your credit checks, provide false
or misleading information, fail to
provide the documents or evidence
requested or fail the right to rent
checks; it will be refundable if the
landlord decides to withdraw.
Property Particulars: We endeavour
to make our property particulars
accurate and reliable, however, they
do not constitute or form part of an
offer or any contract and none is to
be relied upon as statements of
representation or fact. Any services,
systems and appliances listed in this
specification have not been tested by
us and no guarantee as to their
operating ability or efficiency is
given. All measurements have been
taken as a guide to prospective
renters only, and are not precise. If
you require clarification or further
information on any points, please
contact us, especially if you are
travelling some distance to view.
Redress Scheme: The Property
Ombudsman -
https://www.tpos.co.uk/ Tenancy
Deposit Scheme: We lodge deposits
with the DPS – Deposit Protection
Scheme Client Money Protection
Insurance – Member of Client Money
Protect - CMP004791

Accommodation

All measurements are approximate. Further Information

The deposit required is £2,250

The landlord has requested to
include If the Tenants decide to
acquire an additional dog during the
term of this tenancy, the monthly rent
shall be increased by £40 per
calendar month. The Tenants must
notify the Landlord in writing prior to
acquiring the additional dog, and the
increase in rent will commence from
the next rent payment date following
the date the additional dog is brought
into the property.

The landlord is willing to rent this
home to Employed, Self Employed,
Own Means, Retired, Company

The landlord is willing to rent the
property for a minimum of 6 Months
and a maximum of 6 Months

Energy Performance Certificates

This home's performance is rated in
terms of the energy use per square
metre of floor area, energy efficiency
based on fuel costs and
environmental impact based on
carbon dioxide (CO2) emissions.

The energy efficiency rating is a
measure of the overall efficiency of a
home. The higher the rating the more
energy efficient the home is and the
lower the fuel bills will be.

The environmental impact rating is a
measure of a home's impact on the
environment in terms of carbon
dioxide (CO2) emissions. The higher
the rating the less impact it has on
the environment.

Property Ref: inst-5661 Creation Date: 17/09/2025
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IMPORTANT INFORMATION

For clarification, we wish to inform the prospective tenant that we have prepared these details as a general guide. The agent has not carried out a detailed survey nor tested the services, appliances, or
specific fittings (unless otherwise stated), and no warranty can be given as to their condition. All room measurements are taken at floor level. We strongly recommend that all the information which we
provide about the property is verified by yourself and your advisers. The contents of this publication are © Lettings-R-Us, 2025. Lettings-R-Us Registered in England No. 5117944


